
Rome-ing
Around?
DoesFendihaveits eyeon

Willy Chavarria?

Accordingto sources,
the Roman fashionhouse
has haddiscussions

with the NewYork-based

designer,who electrified
ParisFashionWeeklast

Januarywith acoed display
that markedthe 10th

anniversaryof his signature
brand.

Last OctoberKim Jones
partedwayswith Fendi

after four yearsasits
artistic directorof haute

couture, ready-to-wear and

fur collectionsfor women,

making his mark with high-

profile collaborations and

destinationshows.
Sincethenit is

understoodFendihasheld
discussionswith anarray
of potential successors,
includingJohnGalliano,
Maria Grazia Chiuri, who

recently wound up a nine-

year tenureas creative
directorof Dior couture
andwomen’s collections,
and Pierpaolo Piccioli,
the longtime Valentino
designerwho is to succeed

Demna at thecreative

helm of Balenciaga on

July10. One Milan source
alsopointedto Francesco

Risso,who recentlyexited

Marni, asanotherpotential
candidate.

The likelihoodof adeal

with Chavarriacould not

immediatelybelearned.It
is understoodthesearchis
still at preliminary stages,
andthedesignercouldnot

be reachedfor comment.
Silvia Venturini Fendi,

artisticdirectorof

accessoriesandmenswear
collections,has been

leading the designeffort
as Fendicelebratesits

centenaryyear, and is

to stagea coedshow

for spring 2026 during
Milan FashionWeek in

September.
Chavarria is in the

mold of the maverick

designersthatFendiparent
LVMH MoëtHennessy
Louis Vuitton sometimes
recruits Galliano being

anearlyexample, first

tappedfor Givenchy in

1995 and soon after Dior;

AlexanderMcQueen,who

succeededGalliano at
Givenchy, and later Off-

White founderVirgil Abloh,
who rosethroughthe

luxury streetwearranksto
becomeartistic directorof

men’s collections at Louis

Vuitton, which hehelmed

for threeyearsbeforehis
deathin 2021atage41.

In thepastyear,Chavarria

hasbeenhonoredwith

Designerof theYear at the
Latin American Fashion
Awards aswell as theCFDA

MenswearDesignerof the
Year.

Thedesignerhasmade

no secretof his ambition to
benamedcreativedirector

of atop fashion house.

Afteryearsof toiling

away ata slewof brands
including Calvin Klein, Ralph

Lauren,AmericanEagle
Outfitters,Yeezy,Dickies

Constructandothers,the
designeris increasingly
being recognized for

his own collection. To

wit: Chavarria is among
11 finalists for the 2025
ANDAM Fashion Award,

now on its 36th edition.

The prizeceremonyis
scheduledfor June30.

– MILES SOCHAAND LUISA

ZARGANI
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Willy Chavarria,
fall 2025
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