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A SaintLaurentshowbeforedark?

Yes, it happenedon a sunnyTuesday
afternoon and it was delightful, stagedin

the rotundaof the Bourse deCommerce art

museum,where the fashion pack could also

enjoyamesmerizinginstallationby French
artistCélesteBoursier- Mougenot of white
ceramicbowls driftingacrossa shallow

basinofpool-bluewater, occasionally
colliding and producingsoothingpings.

There wasnothing as simple as blue and
white in themen’s collectionby Anthony
Vaccarello, who is tighteninghis grip on
sophisticatedcolor combinationsas an
immediatelyrecognizableYSL brandcode.

He reprisedthe ocher-khaki
combinationfrom his terrific fall women’s
collection,also slidingtogethermint
and navy,andblendingtogethermore
autumnalshades,too, like gold, forest

greenandbordeaux. (The shadesin Larry
Stantonportraitswere areference.)

Vaccarello’sbeanan-pole models filed

aroundthepool with anonchalant

attitude, their handsshovedinto the

pocketsof jaunty little shorts, or tapered,
multipleatpantswith an ’80svibe. All of

themwore outsizedacrylic sunglasses

thatbroughtto mind theonesJohnny

Deppfamouslysportedin “Charlie andthe
Chocolate Factory.”

It wasanabout-face in mood from
Vaccarello’sRobert applethorpe-eso

fall 2025collection,whichWWD described
as“desk to dungeon” as everythingwas

wornwith black leatherthigh-high boots,
which havealreadypretty muchsold out,
by the way.

“Less dark, more light, more sensual–
morefun,” was howthe designer summed

uphis spring effort, meantto evoke “a
suspendedmoment” somewherebetween
Parisand Fire Island in the ’70s.

Tuckedinto the showprogramwasa
black-and-white snapshotof founderYves
Saint Laurenton the tenniscourt circa

1950,his gangly legspoking out of jaunty

shortsjust like thoseonthe runway.>

But Vaccarello pouredmost of his design

energyinto shirts,which were sensational,

with jutting shouldersthanksto extra-

long, removable stays, and generous’8os
volumesthatbillowedover thosetapered
trousers,somewith paper-bagwaists.

The shirtscamein fluid silks with

military pockets,or nearlysheertechnical

nylonsin surprisingcolors like lemon

andpersimmon.Somewerecroppedlike

bomberjackets; one resembledananorak
andwastuckedin neatly.

Tailoring followed thesamefluid lines,
andsolid-colored silk necktieswere worn
with every exit, tuckedinto theshirt
betweenbuttons threeandfour.

“It’s a simple gesture,but it gives another
perspectiveof thesilhouette,” Vaccarello

said. “It’s lessstrict, less in an office.”
Thanksfor thestylingtip, andthe early

call time, Anthony! –Miles Socha
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